
Keith Urban Guitar Sweepstakes – Terms & Conditions 
 
To enter: Register for free to watch the G’Day USA AAA Arts Gala via this link; each 
registration will receive 1 (one) entry into the sweepstakes; Tune in to the livestreamed 
program on February 25, 2021 at 7pm EST; Winner will be announced in the live chat at 
approximately 7:45pm EST, and will be contacted afterwards to arrange shipping. The 
prize is one acoustic guitar signed by Keith Urban, valued at less than $5,000. Please 
contact information@aaanyc.org or 212-338-6860 to obtain the name of the winner 
once the sweepstakes is over. 
 
This sweepstakes is hosted by the American Australian Association (AAA). To be 
eligible to win, contestants must be registered to view the G’Day USA AAA Arts Gala by 
12:00am EST on February 25, 2021; must have a physical address (not P.O. Box) 
within the United States of America; and must watch the gala as it is livestreamed at 
7pm EST on February 25, 2021. Employees of G’Day USA; AAA; any advertising or 
promotional agency, production company, or other contractor involved with the event 
and sweepstakes; family of employees; and people living in the same household as 
individuals otherwise excluded are ineligible for entry into this sweepstakes. 
 
Entries into this sweepstakes are valid from February 1, 2021 until 12:00am EST 
February 25, 2021. Email addresses submitted upon registration will be used to contact 
the sweepstakes winner and will be added to the AAA database. All contacts will be 
provided an opportunity to opt-out of future communications. If the winner does not 
claim the prize within 24 hours of notification, it will be awarded to another contestant 
according to the same rules and procedure. 1 (one) entry per-person and 4 (four) 
entries per-household will be permissible. Entries will be reviewed for duplicates before 
a winner is selected at random; No Purchase Necessary; Donation to the AAA does not 
enhance chance of winning.  
 
The AAA reserves the right to cancel, suspend, or modify the operation and conduct of 
the sweepstakes and the official rules if suspicion or belief arises that the sweepstakes 
has been subject to tampering, possible fraud, or other irregularities. Void where 
prohibited.  
 
 
 

https://artsgala2021.sherpadm.com/client/player/30e16522-0aca-466e-bc71-dd30fb12463f
mailto:information@aaanyc.org

